U.S. Department of the Interior
Office of Self-Governance - Indian Affairs
Self-Governance PROGRESS Act Negotiated Rulemaking Committee
Self-Governance Advisory Committee (SGAC) Update
November 10, 2022
[image: A picture containing icon

Description automatically generated]

[bookmark: _Hlk118716745]Designated Federal Officer (DFO):  
Vickie Hanvey, Office of Self-Governance, ASIA
Vickie.Hanvey@bia.gov     Phone: 918-931-0745
Alternate Designated Federal Officer (DFO):  
Regina Gilbert, Office of Regulatory Affairs and Collaborative Action, ASIA
Regina.Gilbert@bia.gov    Phone: (505) 563-3807
Advisory Committee Management Officer (CMO):  Margaret Triebsch
Facilitation:  Federal Mediation and Conciliation Service (FMCS)
[bookmark: _Hlk115265571]
[bookmark: _Hlk115265264]
Committee Website:   https://www.bia.gov/service/progress-act 
· Contains public access to Federal Register Notices, meeting dates, agenda, minutes, other material.
GSA Annual Comprehensive Review (ACR):  
· The DFO submitted the FY2022 ACR to the GSA Federal Advisory Committee Act (FACA) Database for the CMO review and approval.

CONSENSUS AGREEMENTS SUMMARY:
The Self-Governance PROGRESS Act Negotiated Rulemaking Committee reached consensus on the following items to date:

1. [bookmark: _Hlk115282873]Extension:  Recommending that the Department submit a draft bill as soon as possible to extend the statutory deadlines for the promulgation of regulations implementing the PROGRESS Act.  Specifically, Section 5373 of the title 25, United States Code, is amended—
(1)	in subparagraph (a)(2) by striking “21 months” and inserting “35 months”;  and
(2)	in subparagraph (a)(3) by striking “30 months” and inserting “47 months”. 

(1)	July 21, 2022   to September 21, 2023
(2)	April 21, 2023 to September 21, 2024

2. Audit Threshold Conflict:  In regard to the conflicting audit threshold requirements set forth in the PROGRESS Act ($500,000) and Single Audit Act ($750,000),
a) [bookmark: _Hlk115280530]defer consideration of the proposal to resolve the conflicting audit threshold requirements by technical amendment while the Department obtains a Solicitor’s opinion regarding how to deal with these conflicting provisions; 
b) the Department confer with Indian Health Services regarding these conflicting audit threshold provisions; and 
c) that the Committee continue to separately move forward with its request to extend the deadline for exercising authority to promulgate regulations implementing the PROGRESS Act.

3. Leadership Subcommittee
Task:  Convene administrative meetings for the limited purposes of discussing administrative, operational, or logistical issues. Administrative meetings are not subject to FACA’s open meeting requirements.
Subcommittee: Sharee Freeman, Agency Lead; Scott Aiken Federal Committee member;
Chairman Ron Allen, Tribal Co-Lead; Melanie Fourkiller, Tribal Co-Lead.  In addition, the DFO, Alternate DFO and FMCS. 

4. Protocols Subcommittee
Task:  Develop operating protocols to bring forward to the full Committee
Subcommittee: Consists of eight Tribal subcommittee members and six Federal subcommittee members from the Federal team: 



















Self-Governance PROGRESS Act Negotiated Rulemaking Committee
[image: ]
[image: ]
2 | Page
Self-Governance PROGRESS Act Negotiated Rulemaking Committee
Meeting Summary FINAL
August 29, 2022—Virtual via Zoom
 Page 1 of 2
Self-Governance PROGRESS Act Negotiated Rulemaking Committee
SGAC Update November 10, 2022
image2.emf
NameAffiliation 

W. Ron Allen

Chairman/CEO 

Jamestown S’Klallan Tribe

Melanie Benjamin

Chief Executive 

Mille Lacs Band of Ojbwe

Richard Peterson

President 

Central Council Tlingit and Haida Indian Tribes of Alaska

Michael Dolson

Councilman 

The Confederated Salish and Kootenai Tribes of the Flathead Nation

Melanie Fourkiller

Director of Self-Governance 

Choctaw Nation of Oklahoma

Russel (Buster) Attebery

Chairman 

Karuk Tribe

Karen Fierro

Self-Governance Director 

Ak-Chin Indian Community

Sandra Sampson

Board Treasurer 

Confederated Tribes of the Umatilla Indian Reservation

Jennifer Webster

Councilwoman 

Oneida Nation

Gerry Hope

Transportation Director, Former Tribal Leader 

Sitka Tribe of Alaska

Jody LaMere

Councilwoman 

Chippewa Cree Tribe of the Rocky Boy’s Reservation

Lana Butler

Secretary 

Sac and Fox Nation

Will Micklin

Second Vice President 

Central Council Tlingit and Haida Indian Tribes of Alaska

Annette Bryan

Council Member 

Puyallup Tribes of Indians

 TRIBAL REPRESENTATIVES

PRIMARY Tribal Representatives

ALTERNATE Tribal Representatives


image3.emf
NameAffiliation 

Sharee Feeman

Director

Office of Self-Governance, AS-IA

Jody H. Schwarz

Attorney-Advisor

Branch of Self-Governance and Economic Development, Office of the Solicitor

Kelly Titensor

Native American Affairs Advisor

Bureau of Reclamation

Byron Loosle 

Division Chief

National Conservation Lands, Bureau of Land and Minerals Management.

Scott Aikin

National Native American Programs Coordinator

U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service Head Quarters. 

Rose Petoskey

Senior Counselor to AS-IA

Office of the Assistant Secretary—Indian Affairs.

Matt Kallappa

Northwest Field Office Manager

Office of Self-Governance, AS-IA

Vacant (Andrew Caulum in process)

Attorney-Advisor

Branch of Self-Governance and Economic Development, Office of the Solicitor

Nathalie Washington

Native American Affairs Advisor

Bureau of Reclamation

(Charles) David Johnson

Tribal Liaison

Bureau of Land and Minerals Management. 

Dorothy FireCloud

Native American Affairs Liaison

National Park Service

Samuel Kohn

Senior Counselor to ASIA

Office of the Assistant Secretary—Indian Affairs.

 ALTERNATE Federal Representatives

FEDERAL REPRESENTATIVES

PRIMARY Federal Representatives


image1.jpeg
i Al
H (||




